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PREFACE TO THE SIXTH EDITION
This book on legal system was fist published in 2004. The second,

third and fourth editions were published respectively in July 2006,
March, 2008, and July. 2009. The third edition contains the most of the
fundamental changes introduced by the amendments of the Criminal
Procedure Code, 1898 enacted in 2007- After the implementation of the
long awaited separation of judiciary from the organs of the executive in
November, 2007 in accordance with the landmark judgment of the
Supreme Court in Masder Hossain case back in 1999, there have been
some fundamental changes to the judicial system of the country. After
November 1, 2007 and with the enactment of the Code of Criminal
Procedure (Amendment) Act, 2009 (Act No. 25 of 2009) the basic laws
with regard to the separation of judiciary and newly constituted Judicial
Service Commission are: the Code of Criminal Procedure
(Amendment) Act, 2009 (Act No. 25 of 2009); Bangladesh Judicial
Service Commission Rules, 2007; Bangladesh Judicial Service
(Constitution of Service, Appointment to the Service, Suspension.
Dismissal and Removal) Rules, 2007; Bangladesh Judicial Service
Commission (Posting, Promotion, Grant of Leave, Control, Discipline
and other Conditions of Service) Rules, 2007; and Bangladesh Judicial
Service (Pay Commission) Rules, 2007. In line with these new laws and
rules most of the chapters of this book have been updated.

Apart from necessary amendments and edition in most of the
chapters in view of the above changes, five new chapters have been
added: Chapter 15: Court Reforms and Development Activities in the
Judiciary; Chapter 16: Law Reform and Law Commission; Chapter 17:
Judicial Administration Training Institute; Chapter 18: Law Officers
and Officers of the Court; and Chapter 19: Statistics on Institution,
Disposal and Pending case in the Judiciary. Chapters IV, V, VI, VII,
VIII, IX, XIII and XIV have been updated with recent datas, statistics,
information and case laws. My special thanks to my wife Marzia
Rahman Proma and computer assistant Md. Fourkan who assisted me
by updating all case lists and indexes.

Any comment or suggestion regarding this edition will be cordially
accepted and acknowledged in the next edition.

Md. Abdul Halim
ha1ini_mdyahoo.co.uk



PREFACE TO THE FIRST EDITION
In taking an initiative to write The Legal System of Bangladesh it is

not my intention to provide a comprehensive and empirical survey of
the legal system of Bangladesh. My aim is rather to produce a topical
account of some of the major important institutions, their historical
trace-up and practices which ft)rrn part of our legal process and legal
reasoning. Though the whole work has grown out of my personal
interest, the force behind is the demand of the first year students of law
in most of the universities which have recently introduced The Legal
System of Bangladesh in their curriculum. Apart form the students of
law, the book will certainly be of immense importance for those
interested in learning the system of law and legal institutions in the
country and also for those studying the Bar Vocational Course in
Bangladesh and other advocacy or legal clinical courses. It is hoped that
they will find it a comprehensible treatment of the subjects with which
it deals and that the material contained in it will be rendered more
accessible and digestible to them by the use of frequent sub-headings.

The administration of justice in a legal system is run and
administered by the interaction of some essential organs: courts both
civil, criminal and special; the judiciary, i.e. the judges; the legal
profession, i.e. advocates; law officers, e.g. the Attorney-General,
public prosecutors, public pleader, registrars of the court etc; and the
jail nd police. The main idea behind this work is basically to provide
socio-legal and functional understanding of these organs at first hand.

Apart from the structural side of a legal system as mentioned above,
the legal system of a country also encompasses the historical
development, the present working procedure of legal institutions and
also the conceptual components which include, inter alia, the rules of
judicial precedent, statutory interpretation, legislation. All these aspects
of conceptual components have also been covered in this book. As a
part of historical development of law courts I have ventured to sketch
periodic stages commencing from the ancient Indian legal systems
down to the present system in Bangladesh which I hope will be able to
meet the need of a short, co-ordinated integrated and coherent account
of the important phases of the development of legal institutions in
Bangladesh.



Arranged in fourteen chapters the book starts with introduction of
law and legal system as understood in general in the first chapter. The
second chapter deals with the historical development of court system;
chapters third, fourth, and fifth deals with the present court structure
and their functioning in three heads: the Supreme Court, the
subordinate courts and special courts and tribunals; chapters six and
seven deal with the procedure of civil and criminal cases; chapter eight
deals with police power of arrest, detention and bail; chapter nine deals
with appeal, review, revision and reference which are post-trial steps of
a litigation; chapters ten, eleven and twelve deal with respectively
legislation, precedent and statutory interpretation which are the
essential conceptual components of a legal system; chapter thirteen
deals with legal aid and the last chapter fourteen deals with legal
profession. I had intention to add some more chapters particularly one
on the Law Commissions and its activities so far; and one on the
problems on the court procedure and court management in Bangladesh
which, however, I have been unable to do at this stage. I hope to add
these in next edition.

I acknowledge with gratitude my indebtedness to Advocate Md.
Abdul Aziz who has always been very sincere and helpful in making me
understand different court procedure and conceptual problems in
Bangladesh as I myself is still a learner on the subject. My indebtedness
to Mr. Lutfar Rahman, Additional SF, Bhola, Mr. Ikteder Ahmed,
Secretary, the Law Commission, my friend Dr. Faustina Pereira, Deputy
Director, Ain 0 Shalish Kendra, Jafrul Hasan Sharif, staff lawyer of
BLAST, Azizur Rahman (Dulu) who assisted me either by providing
information or documents on different parts of this book.

I am grateful to Mr. Kazi Tauhid Hasan. Director of the Bangladesh
Parliament Library and particularly to Md. Abu Dawood. Librarian and
their staff for the sincere help I received from them.

My special thanks go for my friend Dr. Faustina Pereira, Deputy
Director, Ain 0 Shalish Kendra, Advocate Sukesh Majumder, Azizur
Rahman (Dulit), student of Department of Law, Dhaka University who
not only provided information but also have been a source of inspiration
all along this work.



The preparation of this book was facilitated by my younger brother
A.M Jamal Hossain, student of MBA, Dhaka University who employed
most of his spare time in composing, preparing indexes and arranging
footnotes with charm and great ability. Lam deeply in his debt. I express
my heartfelt gratitude to my publisher Yousuf Ali Khan, for his co-
operation in processing this edition.

The views and opinions expressed in this book are absolutely mine
except those which I have quoted. I do not claim that my views are
correct from every point of view. There may be shortcomings, factual
errors, mistaken opinion and stylistic lapses which all are mine and I
alone am responsible for those. If there are mistakes in facts or
otherwise I shall appreciate if readers come forward to have corrected by
me so that the second edition may be a better volume.

House No. 40/Ka	 Md. Abdul Halim
Road No. 6
P.C. Culture Housing,
Mohammadpur, Dhaka.
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